
RFP 2021-082
Ground-Based Mosquito Control and Surveillance Activities

Primary Award Secondary Award

Section 1- Mosquito Surveillance Activities

Maximum 
Point 
Value

PRP Services LLC
d/b/a Municipal 

Mosquito
Richardson, TX

HUB - Yes
COOP - Yes

Vector Disease Control 
International

Little Rock, AR
HUB - No

COOP - Yes

15 9.00 9.00

10 6.00 6.00

15 10.00 9.00

20 10.67 10.67

10 6.66 7.33

30 30.00 26.51

100 72.33 68.51

Price

Total

References

Qualifications, Experience and Safety Record

Ability to Start Activity within 24 Hours of Request

Equipment: Including Spray System, Calibration, GPS

Proposed Approach to Ground Spraying Process

Clarke Environmental Mosquito Management submitted a no-bid.



RFP 2021-082
Ground-Based Mosquito Control and Surveillance Activities

Primary Award Secondary Award

Section 2-Truck-Mounted ULV Ground Spraying

Maximum 
Point 
Value

PRP Services LLC
d/b/a Municipal 

Mosquito
Richardson, TX

HUB - Yes
COOP - Yes

Vector Disease Control 
International

Little Rock, AR
HUB - No

COOP - Yes

15 9.00 9.00

10 6.00 6.00

15 10.00 9.00

20 12.00 12.00

10 6.66 7.33

30 30.00 28.12

100 73.66 71.45

Qualifications, Experience and Safety Record

Ability to Start Activity within 24 Hours of Request

Equipment: Including Spray System, Calibration, GPS

Proposed Approach to Ground Spraying Process

References

Price

Total

Clarke Environmental Mosquito Management submitted a no-bid.



RFP 2021-082
Ground-Based Mosquito Control and Surveillance Activities

Primary Award Secondary Award

Maximum 
Point 
Value

PRP Services LLC
d/b/a Municipal 

Mosquito
Richardson, TX

HUB - Yes
COOP - Yes

Vector Disease Control 
International

Little Rock, AR
HUB - No

COOP - Yes

15 9.00 9.00

10 6.00 6.00

15 11.00 9.00

20 12.00 12.00

10 6.66 7.33

30 30.00 9.97

100 74.66 53.30

Qualifications, Experience and Safety Record

Ability to Start Activity within 24 Hours of Request

Equipment: Including Spray System, Calibration, GPS

Proposed Approach to Ground Spraying Process

References

Price

Total

Section 3-ATV-Mounted and Backpack-Mounted
ULV and/or Thermal Fogging

Clarke Environmental Mosquito Management submitted a no-bid.



RFP 2021-082
Ground-Based Mosquito Control and Surveillance Activities

Primary Award Secondary Award

Section 4-Truck-Mounted LV Larviciding

Maximum 
Point 
Value

PRP Services LLC
d/b/a Municipal 

Mosquito
Richardson, TX

HUB - Yes
COOP - Yes

Vector Disease Control 
International

Little Rock, AR
HUB - No

COOP - Yes

15 9.00 9.00

10 6.00 6.00

15 10.00 9.00

20 12.00 10.67

10 6.66 7.33

30 30.00 25.74

100 73.66 67.74

References

Price

Total

Proposed Approach to Ground Spraying Process

Qualifications, Experience and Safety Record

Ability to Start Activity within 24 Hours of Request

Equipment: Including Spray System, Calibration, GPS

Clarke Environmental Mosquito Management submitted a no-bid.



RFP 2021-082
Ground-Based Mosquito Control and Surveillance Activities

Primary Award Secondary Award

Maximum 
Point 
Value

PRP Services LLC
d/b/a Municipal 

Mosquito
Richardson, TX

HUB - Yes
COOP - Yes

Vector Disease Control 
International

Little Rock, AR
HUB - No

COOP - Yes

15 9.00 9.00

10 6.00 6.00

15 10.00 9.00

20 12.00 10.67

10 6.66 7.33

30 30.00 19.41

100 73.66 61.41Total

Section 5-ATV-Mounted and Backpack-Mounted LV 
Larviciding

Qualifications, Experience and Safety Record

Ability to Start Activity within 24 Hours of Request

Equipment: Including Spray System, Calibration, GPS

Proposed Approach to Ground Spraying Process

References

Price

Clarke Environmental Mosquito Management submitted a no-bid.



RFP 2021-082
Ground-Based Mosquito Control and Surveillance Activities

Primary Award Secondary Award

Section 6-Mosquito Inspection and Larviciding

Maximum 
Point 
Value

PRP Services LLC
d/b/a Municipal 

Mosquito
Richardson, TX

HUB - Yes
COOP - Yes

Vector Disease Control 
International

Little Rock, AR
HUB - No

COOP - Yes

15 9.00 9.00

10 6.00 6.00

15 9.00 9.00

20 12.00 9.33

10 6.66 7.33

30 30.00 28.93

100 72.66 69.59

Price

Total

Qualifications, Experience and Safety Record

Ability to Start Activity within 24 Hours of Request

Equipment: Including Spray System, Calibration, GPS

Proposed Approach to Ground Spraying Process

References

Clarke Environmental Mosquito Management submitted a no-bid.


	Totals

