RFB 2022-151 A/C for Prisoner Van Conversion

Award

PURSUIT SAFETY, INC

ROYSE CITY, TX

Coop Yes
HUB No
ltem| Description | Qty Price Total
Section 1: New System Installation - Custom Built
1 Extradition System No bid No bid
2 Transport System No bid No bid
3 | Pick Up Delivery Fee No bid No bid
Section Total
Section 2: New System Installation - Prefabricated Kit
1 Extradition System $ 15,500.00 | $ 15,500.00
2 Transport System $ 28,800.00 | $ 28,800.00
3 | Pick Up Delivery Fee CGtoPU/Deliver | CGtoPU/Deliver
Section Total $ 44,300.00
Section 3: Refurbishment of Existing System - Custom Built
1 Extradition System 118% 7,500.00 | $ 7,500.00
2 Transport System 719% 9,200.00 | $ 64,400.00
3 | Pick Up Delivery Fee | 1 | CGtoPU/Deliver | CGtoPU/Deliver
Section Total $ 71,900.00
Section 4: Refurbishment of Existing System - Prefabricated Kit
1 Extradition System $ 7,500.00 | $ 7,500.00
2 Transport System $ 9,200.00 | $ 9,200.00
3 | Pick Up Delivery Fee CGtoPU/Deliver | CGtoPU/Deliver
Section Total $ 16,700.00
Additional Pricing
Hourly Rate for Repairs to Existing
Systems $85.00
Parts Mark-Up for Parts Used
During Repairs 5%
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